RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/37831

Y , 3feh QuR] TR, Aiegal 9, R033/hITdeh 2§, ITh 2%y [gs 3, fomer: B0 Q.00

STITRUT hHieh ¥R0

UTFerghd AT
HERTS AT HeRTe Tfufermi-a aam shetet
(T Uk, Teh- 37 MFUT Ueh—oT ATHER UTHg hetel (A o 3T AieAfafierT) fram o stewr.

Taa fawmr

gTCHT TSTE <ok, IS hIHT |, WA,

e ¥oo 033, fEih © &R 3033
3rferg= T

[N

HENTS Hoaaterd s JefTam, 2002,

IR oI L4R3/H.5h. Y& /FTEM- L, —SAT3Tell, HERTe STEHTE 797 @I Siell 3718 o, HeRTg Jeaafed
131, R0 04 TEA ATcehics. YEARUN 0TI URFEI FHfor STt 312 3711 HeRTe Jezrafeia s =, R00%
(Roo4 AL & ) AT heTH ¢ 3 AT Ule-ohetd (¥ ) AT WIHITHR T IR T8 AAG! SUam=i 37¢ Tesvdrel TR
T

TEUM, I A= Het ¢ 3 <A1 We-sherd (%) A Wehas We-hetd () STfor () =T wrekiten
TR HEA T ANISHTT T Sl Hel STERRIT SR e, ATER HERIG I, HERIG qogared & -,
R0 ok HE Weiie] YERUN hId 378, TEUTT :—

9. 1 M HeRTg Hegaftid o (FaRom) =M, 3013 319 Hareuard ard.
. BRI GeFared o R, ooy = TR € = 3u-fem (e@) Hel,—
(2) @S (F) 788, —
(k) "3 auiqda" 1 SsaiasT A auiuEd" € ¥eE SRaet HuATd Id 3R,
(TF) "urEe ¥ A7 JsguaS "Here au" @ I1e SRael HUATd Ad TR,

(2)

YT IR-d-¥R0—2



TERTSE I TS STETRUT T TR-, AIegsl o, 2033 /hlfcieh L&, ITeh 23%Y
(R) @S (@) 7, —
(k) "3 auiqdd" 91 Ssaiast A SN € 9e8 SRael SHudTd Id 3R ;
(TF) "SI TN 91 YU eI a¥" ® TS SRl ShUaTd I 2718 ;
(3) @8 (1) v, —
(k) "3 auigdd" 91 Srsaiast A o € 9eE SRael HuATd Id 3R ;

() "Tre a¥" A1 YsauaST TR Y § IeS Il AT A 3Ted.

He RN {[vqY]ed RIE) aléSllﬂﬂ Iaqﬂﬁ,

HAR hesoh,

MG 39 Afd.




TERTSE JITH TSTUS STHTERUT HWRT IR-, FIeee 9, 033 /ahifdeh 2§, ITeh 2%y 3
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai 400 032, dated the 7th November 2023.

NOTIFICATION
MAHARASHTRA VALUE ADDED Tax Act, 2002.

No. VAT-1523/CR-59/Taxation-1.—Whereas, the Government of Maharashtra is satisfied
that circumstances exist which render it necessary to take immediate action further to amend the
Maharashtra Value Added Tax Rules, 2005 and to dispense with the condition of previous publication
thereof under the proviso to sub-section (4) of section 83 of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Act,
2002 (Mah. IX of 2005) ;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-sections (1) and (2) read with the
proviso to sub-section (4) of section 83 of the said Act, and of all other powers enabling it in this
behalf, the Government of Maharashtra hereby, makes the following rules further to amend the
Maharashtra Value Added Tax Rules, 2005, namely :—

1. These rules may be called the Maharashtra Value Added Tax (Amendment) Rules, 2023.
2. In rule 6 of the Maharashtra Value Added Tax Rules, 2005, in sub-rule (1B),—
(i) in clause (a),—
(i) for the words “two years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted ;
(i1) for the words “sixty-five years”, the words “sixty-six years” shall be substituted ;
(i1) in clause (b),—
(i) for the words “two years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted ;
(i) for the words “sixty-two years”, the words “sixty-six years” shall be substituted ;
(Zi1) in clause (¢),—
(i) for the words “two years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted ;

(i1) for the words “sixty years”, the words “sixty-one years” shall be substituted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

MANDAR KELKAR,
Deputy Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



