Rt &, 1.0~ 33004/99

REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.5, -3.Te.-31.-01022025-260695
CG-DL -E-01022025-260695

ETETIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT | |—EvE 3—I7-T0E (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

grfee ¥ TFfaT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

g. 75] TS faeelY, AT, weadt 1, 202587 12, 1946

No. 75] NEW DELHI, SATURDAY, FEBRUARY 1, 2025/MAGHA 12, 1946
ENEEISE]
(Trorem famT)

75 fReett, 1 weady, 2025
. 07/2025-S T (T.ET.)

qr.a . 108(s7).— =T T, HHT9es ATa=aw, 1962 (1962 FT 52), Ft T 156 FT J&
AIRFAT T TART XA U, HIATY (o5 il RATIAT 3T 9 AT [T Sifad START & forw A7t &1 31a7a)
fRwTastt, 2022 F1 Gerree w3 & forg Meferied e aqrdt g, steiq-

1. |fer| 9 ST IR - (1) =4 et &1 "ty 9 dmges (9o fit REmdt 37 9w ar &t
ST\ ST  forw 91er =1 arara) gerrere a9, 2025 21

(2) T 02 w¥a<T, 2025 T I g

2. HroTeed (U H RAmEt @ 9w At @t sifaw STt % forw /T #7 sra) Faemae, 2022

(T =¥ =8 T4Td 9o Fa% Fg7 147 ), F =9 3 7, 3uaw 1 #, g2 (2) F o=, Futated
G ST EATIIT TR ST, 7aiq-

858 G1/2025 Q)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

a7, "B § uF wdew A F A, 91, e s fREew ¥ sfow fm # wwm g oA
et i et Foree AT it srafer srfene &5

3. wo At &, = 6 &, Sufaaw (2) #, IT T 92 A1 FTer 958 "AIHE" i "}rg" 95l
T I AT AT 37 " Bt aeg T S

4, q FFwiF, A7 F, -
(i) IUFRTHT (1) &, ATHF' 9167 T I THIF' 9768 T SATUAT
(ii) U= (3) #, '6 HIZ ' 9Teal €A I "UF 9" oreg ¥ ST
5. ¥ Al F, FEw 8 %, sufaaw (1) §, 'AIf¥a' 9Te7 & €79 9% SHIHF e 1@l ST
6. o fAFwi ¥, Fow 9 %, sufa=w (1) #, A1 a53 % T 9¢ 'A/THF' 9758 H TET AT0
7. I = F, w10 F, -
(i) SYF=H (1), @< (i) #, '6 |18 ' oTsal * T I¥ 'UF T 75 TG A0
(ii) YRR (2) §, ATF" 9768 * €I I "FHIHF' 2768 TGT STUAT
(iii) Y= (3) , AIHF" 9168 * TATH I "FHTF' 2168 TEGT STUAT
(iv) YIS (5) |, HIHF' 9767 F T 9 A/ o768 T@T AT
8. I fAFHT F, TI= A #IA-3 H, HIHF' 952 % T I "JHITHF' Te7 T@T STUAT
[T, &. Freftemset -530524/2/2025-0/0 fh2ere (H1HT 97e)- HEe]
AT TTETFE, e (HHT )
feoron- qor e |, 74/2022-fmmee® (UAAL), A 09 fde, 2022, AE % SO, AETHTW,

a1, g% 3, IUEe (i) @eaiw ararfA. 692 (31), ara 10 fAdeaw, 2022 g ywrfea o 7w
|

MINISTRY OF FINANCE
(Department Of Revenue)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 1st February, 2025
No. 07/2025- Customs (N.T.)

G.S.R. 108(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 156 of the Customs Act, 1962 (52 of 1962),
the Central Government hereby makes the following rules to amend the Customs (Import of Goods at Concessional
Rate of Duty or for Specified End Use) Rules, 2022, namely :-

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Customs (Import of Goods at
Concessional Rate of Duty or for Specified End Use) Amendment Rules, 2025

(2) They shall come into force on the 2" day of February, 2025.

2. In the Customs (Import of Goods at Concessional Rate of Duty or for Specified End Use) Rules, 2022
(hereinafter referred to as the principal rules), in rule 3, in sub-rule (1), after clause k, the following clause
shall be inserted, namely:-



[¢TRT 11—&vE 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

‘ka. "quarter” means a period comprising any three consecutive calendar months ending on the last
day of March, June, September or December of a calendar year;’.

In the principal rules, in rule 6, in sub-rule (2), for the words “monthly” and “month” occurring at both
places, the words “quarterly” and “quarter” shall respectively be substituted.

In the principal rules, inrule 7, -
(i) in sub-rule (1), for the word “monthly”, the word “quarterly” shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub-rule (3), for the words “six months”, the words “one year” shall be substituted.

In the principal rules, in rule 8, in sub-rule (1), for the word “monthly”, the word “quarterly” shall be
substituted.

In the principal rules, in rule 9, in sub-rule (1), for the word “monthly”, the word “quarterly” shall be
substituted.

In the principal rules, in rule 10, -
(i) insub-rule (1), in clause (ii), for the words “six months”, the words “one year” shall be substituted,;
(i) in sub-rule (2), for the word “monthly”, the word “quarterly” shall be substituted;
(iii) in sub-rule (3), for the word “monthly”, the word “quarterly” shall be substituted;
(iv) in sub-rule (5), for the word “monthly”, the word “quarterly” shall be substituted.

In the principal rules, in Form IGCR-3, for the word “MONTHLY”, the word “QUARTERLY” shall be
substituted.

[F. No. CBIC-530524/2/2025-0/0 Dir(Customs)-CBEC]
ANANTH RATHAKRISHNAN, Director (Customs)

Note: - The principal rules No.74/2022- Customs (N.T.), dated the 09" September, 2022 was published in the Gazette

of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide number G.S.R.692 (E), dated the
10" September, 2022.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. sArvesk kumag

SRIVASTAVA




		2025-02-01T19:11:15+0530
	SARVESH KUMAR SRIVASTAVA




