TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

JHITAd = JA3TUA
Che Gazette of India

Or.5M.-21.Te1.-31.-30122024-259718
CG-DL-E-30122024-259718

SFATYTIOT
EXTRAORDINARY

AT | 1—Evs 4
PART Il1—Section 4

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 1029] 7E feeeft, WTeraT<, fR|waIT 24, 2024/97W 3, 1946
No. 1029] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, DECEMBER 24, 2024/PAUSHA 3, 1946

AT qEE=r At sfgemr
feg=AT
¢ feeeft, 23 Ry, 2024

. rsi-13/1/(1)/2023-TEHAT_THET-|.—AT  qxE= [AfFgms  srfasr
afarfaaa, 1997 (1997 T 24) #F¥ &y 11 Ft ITATT (1) F @< (&) F IUG< (i) F 1 qiod oy
11 ¥ ITYRT (2) F FR(q T ATRAT FHT TN Fd g, AR a7 Af=amas srfdere,
TIEATE ¢ ofaer, 1999 § ST H9erd Fi g MAfead a9l FIdT g, ATHd: -

TEAT TRE (AT GLTeT) Sraer, 2024
(2024 %7 2)
1. =i sfrdes, HaT s aro-
(1) TH ST T TLHATT SF (TALAT HLTGA) 3raer, 2024 Fgl SATUAT
(2) T ATSLT AT TSI H THeh T il qIE F G (3 o 918 AR [T
2. TIHATT SH M1eer, 1999 F @T 2 H -
(i) IT-Tve (da) ¥, "Teo faq" «=al & T 9%, "di &7 963 faa" oreg wiaetiua fhu Sruar;

(i) IT-TUE (ma) H, "Teof fa" oTeat & ¥4 U, "d19 |7 7% faq" orsg wiaeariog o
STa
8309 G1/2024 M




2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

feoqeft 1. - TE= &Rw s, 1999, faai® 09 AT, 1999, Afeg=AT H&ar 99/3 + Faq
ARG & SO, TETER, 9 |, @€ 4 § FH1qq gam oA, 3T a8 qorsra [eterted
SrferTeN gy Jerrtera oy T -

e &, srfdrgaT HeaT wd R
19T 301-4/99-ATgfawm (i) faAi+ 30.03.1999
27T 301-4/99-ATg T (hi ) faAT 31.05.1999
3 301-4/99-sTrgfarsT (31 ) fa=i 31.05.1999
497 301-4/99-ATg T (hi7 ) faAT+ 28.07.1999
5at 301-4/99-sTTgfarsT (317 ) fa=ih 17.09.1999
6t 301-4/99-ATZ AT (ST ) a7 30.09.1999
74t 301-8/2000-sTrgf=T (317 ) fa=i= 30.03.2000
8t 301-8/2000-sTrgf=T (Si ) 371 31.07.2000
ot 301-8/2000-sTrgf=T (317 ) fawi=h 28.08.2000
109t 306-1/99-wrgfa9T (£ ) fa=r= 09.11.2000
114t 310-1(5)/aTgfadT -2000 fa=7= 25.01.2001
12 9 301-9/2000-sTrgf=T (S ) fami=h 25.01.2001
13 =t 303-4/s1gf39T -2001 =21 01.05.2001
14 77 306-2/5TTgf=9T -2001 {31 24.05.2001
15 =t 310-1(5)/aTgfaT -2000 fa=7 20.07.2001
16 T 310-5(17)/2001-rg =T (1w )% 14.08.2001
17 =t 301/2/2002-s1gfaT (21 ) faeis 22.01.2002
18 T 303/3/2002-9T5[a9T (217 ) fa=i= 30.01.2002
19 at 303/3/2002-ATg = (%cth ) fe=F 28.02.2002
20 =7 312-7/2001-ST1gf39T (1) 14.03.2002
21 =t 301-6/2002-sT1gf=T (Si7 ) =T 13.06.2002
22 =T 312-5/2002-A1gfa9T (T%T) &A1 04.07.2002
23 =t 303/8/2002-9T5[a9T (217 ) fa=i= 06.09.2002
24 =i 306-2/2003-z=i+ fa=T+ 24.01.2003
25 =T 306-2/2003-z%i+ fami® 12.03.2003
26 =T 306-2/2003-z#1 {37 27.03.2003
27 =t 303/6/2003-AT5[aT (3% ) fami 25.04.2003
28 =T 301-51/2003-z={= {37 05.11.2003
29 =i 301-56/2003-3=(7 fawi= 03.12.2003




[\ HH—aTs 4] BIESEEIRISEE S RIEIEU

30 =t 301-4/2004 (=17 ) fami= 16.01.2004
31 &t 301-2/2004-z=T fa=1% 07.07.2004

32 &t 301-37/2004-2=T fa7 07.10.2004

33 at 301-31/2004-%=1 fasi 08.12.2004

34 =t 310-3(1)/2003-z=T {27 11.03.2005
35 =t 310-3(1)/2003-zT a7 31.03.2005
36 &t 312-7/2003-z=7 fa=i+ 21.04.2005

37 &t 312-7/2003-<=T faaT® 02.05.2005

38 =t 312-7/2003-2= fa=i+ 02.06.2005

39 =t 310-3(1)/2003-z=T {21 08.09.2005
40 =T 310-3(1)/2003-z=T {211 16.09.2005
41 4T 310-3(1)/2003-z=T {2 29.11.2005
42 a7 301-34/2005-2=T fais 07.03.2006

43 7T 301-2/2006-z=T fasi 21.03.2006

44 =i 301-34/2006-z=T {37+ 24.01.2007

45 i 301-18/2007-2=1 fa=i 05.06.2007

46 =T 301-36/2007-z=T fais 24.01.2008

A7 a7 301-14/2008-z=T fai= 17.03.2008

48 =t 301-31/2007-2=1 fa=1i 01.09.2008

49 =T 301-25/2009-231< T 20.11.2009
50 at 301-24/2012-=1< fa=i® 19.04.2012
51 =t 301-26/2011-231% f31= 20.04.2012
52 =t 301-41/2012-T%&=1 A% 19.09.2012
53 3T 301-39/2012-t%&=T faei® 01.10.2012
54 =t 301-59/2012-T%&=1T {2 05.11.2012
55 =t 301-10/2012-T%&=T fasi® 17.06.2013
56 at 301-26/2012-5=1< fa=i+ 26.11.2013
57 =t 312-2/2013-T%&3U faAi+ 14.07.2014
58 3T 312-2/2013-t%&3U fa=i+ 01.08.2014
59 =t 310-5 (2)/2013-TH&ZT a1 21.11.2014
60 at 301-16/2014-T%&= 0 fa=T+ 09.04.2015
614t 301-30/2016-TH&=T faei= 22.11.2016




4

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

62 a7 301-30/2016-TH&=T faAi 27.12.2016
63 a1 312-1/2017-tw&=z1 faAiF 16.02.2018

64 3T 301-20/2018-TH&=T fa=T® 24.09.2018
65 a1 301-03/2020-t%&= T fasi® 03.06.2020
66 a7 #1-3/7/(5)/2021-tFzu-1 faTF 27.01.2022
67 at H1-3/7/(5)/2021-t%z0-1 faAT+ 31.03.2022
68 aT H1/(5)/2021-tF=0-|| faATH 07.04.2022

69 aT #1/(2)/2021-tFzu-| fa=TF 06.12.2022
feroquit 2- =TT ATIA § AT SR (FTat Sed) e, 2024 F IZ9AT 37T HIL0N T AT
[ERIRIE I

ATSATHS ATIT

%) WEATET ST gfH:

1.

2.

srtereReer 7 e 2022 & Faa¥ 2022 F A9 TEATT AT & S AT Hatead ol & q9g 7
T SUSIHT TA&q0T rATtora Rt o, ST Sgex R &t |t om:

o AT H TF & fAT 9T IUTIRTA i 10 |
o Y wmeer # errfoer SusTRT Gveror At i wwresferar

o UH ST % THTAH H EATE "aT Yarar (Sruadr) g fau v s # arefdar =
£ gaTaefierar

ATZATT F ITAIHTEA, ST0HUT, =T T =T RAGTRT & I hiea® 6 g 92 &G+ 26 7%,
2024 T TEATT ITATHT GeAv Ffezm (EHdiem), 2012 £ qfiar gq vF 9w 95 Sy
fFam 7g 9= BT 7 & 139 & AT w1 GAMAd war g, [FOT SR amsE (THéE) 67
FIFET ATIAL (FAT) 92 FaqT 90 o=t it FwT it FHear 2 ¥ saeT=har T 941 AT g A7
T Heaiwd Far g T Fa7 [Afre U9 @€ UadEl S "iet & forn fEEaria Jear |

ATATead BT T gl

q) RaurHi & I Jare:

1.

TRTHET I F AT § THITHULET, S0ady, SAhal T ITAHT Tqg1 FT FTA = e FeT aral &
T 41 feoafort s 5 gfa-feeaforat s g2 7 feoafort wrgfaT it aa@rse o2 qrass &7 9
ST 3| FATHe Ragmat it ARfaErT & 919 fGAi® 21 dFgay, 2024 F7 UF AqarsT gar 59
FAT (ATTAST) FT AT HAT AT 2T GAT HF FAT (ATTAST) F TATT TS, AA I hieash i
ITH Ul

THEAT 3T FIT AT ol T&TdT FET % Hg, I, ATAHiera: RBaemehi 7 #isar 90 faai & oy it
=T F@T FT g A EEE #49r yerars (@oadr) F @ Gy & GEET g7 @ e

TRged & T@d gu 90-fam it HHT [T &7 Tl 8, 3fiT 2 TeAgeed =d a1 ¥ 9gad I T
ST TEAT T STATHIN T ATC-aATE AT FaTd & g oot

Raarai & A= s #isEr e 9% fER F13% F T, S Ser-Amt 8% #r 365 A aw
& JuraT it ST 39T &, ITrerwor &7 o= § 3 vadidt sfix €t % forg dearn s &0 90 f_Ret
T TgTHT 365 fom fFar stmor 365 fRet 9% it &< srafy & ™ ¥ I-aR R @
AELIHAT THTH BT AT TS, FAT TITQT AT AT AT FH IoAT a1 G J97 HLA H7 {Saheq
T TG T B




[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 5

FEATHI; T TLHAT S (AT HeTe) Maer, 2024 T ®T & RS # forg 0 g7a=w
R (FEat demed) seer, 2024 FT1 BEr aqare g1 T off st amaer |, st § forar
TEAT < (ALAT |HLTe) 3aeT, 2024 AT R

T T, adEEN
[Far=TTa=-111/4/3147./846/2024-25]

TELECOM REGULATORY AUTHORITY OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, 23rd December, 2024

No. RG-13/1/(1)/2023-ADV_FEA-1. —In exercise of the powers conferred upon it under sub-section (2)
of section 11, read with sub-clause (i) of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of the said section, of the Telecom Regulatory
Authority of India Act, 1997 (24 of 1997), the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India hereby makes the following
Order further to amend the Telecommunication Tariff Order, 1999, namely: -

THE TELECOMMUNICATION TARIFF (SEVENTIETH AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2024
(2 of 2024)
1. Short title, extent and commencement:
(1) This Order may be called the Telecommunication Tariff (Seventieth Amendment) Order, 2024.
(2) This Order shall come into force after thirty days from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.
2. Inclause 2 of the Telecommunication Tariff Order, 1999 —

(i) in sub-clause (da), for the words “ninety days”, the words “three hundred and sixty-five days” shall be
substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (ma), for the words “ninety days”, the words “three hundred and sixty-five days” shall be
substituted.

Note.1. — The Telecommunication Tariff Order, 1999 was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part IlI,
Section 4 under notification No. 99/3 dated 09th March, 1999, and subsequently amended as given below:-

Amendment No. Notification No. and Date
1st 301-4/99-TRAI (Econ) dated 30.03.1999
2nd 301-4/99-TRAI(Econ) dated 31.05.1999
3rd 301-4/99-TRAI(Econ) dated 31.05.1999
4th 301-4/99-TRAI(Econ) dated 28.07.1999
5th 301-4/99-TRAI(Econ) dated 17.09.1999
6th 301-4/99-TRAI(Econ) dated 30.09.1999
7th 301-8/2000-TRAI(Econ) dated 30.03.2000
8th 301-8/2000-TRAI(Econ) dated 31.07.2000
9th 301-8/2000-TRAI(Econ) dated 28.08.2000
10th 306-1/99-TRAI(Econ) dated 09.11.2000
11th 310-1(5)/TRAI-2000 dated 25.01.2001
12th 301-9/2000-TRAI(Econ) dated 25.01.2001
13th 303-4/TRAI-2001 dated 01.05.2001
14th 306-2/TRAI-2001 dated 24.05.2001
15th 310-1(5)/TRAI-2000 dated 20.07.2001
16th 310-5(17)/2001-TRAI(Econ)dated 14.08.2001




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

17th 301/2/2002-TRAI(Econ) dated 22.01.2002
18th 303/3/2002-TRAI(Econ) dated 30.01.2002
19th 303/3/2002-TRAI(Econ) dated 28.02.2002
20th 312-7/2001-TRAI(Econ) 14.03.2002

21st 301-6/2002-TRAI(Econ) dated 13.06.2002
22nd 312-5/2002-TRAI(Eco) dated 04.07.2002
23rd 303/8/2002-TRAI(Econ) dated 06.09.2002
24th 306-2/2003-Econ dated 24.01.2003

25th 306-2/2003-Econ dated 12.03.2003

26th 306-2/2003-Econ dated 27.03.2003

27th 303/6/2003-TRAI(Econ) dated 25.04.2003
28th 301-51/2003-Econ dated 05.11.2003

29th 301-56/2003-Econ dated 03.12.2003

30th 301-4/2004(Econ) dated 16.01.2004

31st 301-2/2004-Eco dated 07.07.2004

32nd 301-37/2004-Eco dated 07.10.2004

33rd 301-31/2004-Eco dated 08.12.2004

34th 310-3(1)/2003-Eco dated 11.03.2005

35th 310-3(1)/2003-Eco dated 31.03.2005

36th 312-7/2003-Eco dated 21.04.2005

37th 312-7/2003-Eco dated 02.05.2005

38th 312-7/2003-Eco dated 02.06.2005

39th 310-3(1)/2003-Eco dated 08.09.2005

40th 310-3(1)/2003-Eco dated 16.09.2005

41st 310-3(1)/2003-Eco dated 29.11.2005
42nd 301-34/2005-Eco dated 07.03.2006

43rd 301-2/2006-Eco dated 21.03.2006

44th 301-34/2006-Eco dated 24.01.2007

45th 301-18/2007-Eco dated 05.06.2007

46th 301-36/2007-Eco dated 24.01.2008

47th 301-14/2008-Eco dated 17.03.2008

48th 301-31/2007-Eco dated 01.09.2008

49th 301-25/2009-ER dated 20.11.2009

50th 301-24/2012-ER dated 19.04.2012

51st 301-26/2011-ER dated 20.04.2012

52nd 301-41/2012-F&EA dated 19.09.2012
53rd 301-39/2012-F&EA dated 01.10.2012
54th 301-59/2012-F&EA dated 05.11.2012
55th 301-10/2012-F&EA dated 17.06.2013
56th 301-26/2012-ER dated 26.11.2013




[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 7

57th 312-2/2013-F&EA dated 14.07.2014
58th 312-2/2013-F&EA dated 01.08.2014
59th 310-5 (2)/2013-F&EA dated 21.11.2014
60th 301-16/2014-F&EA dated 09.04.2015
61st 301-30/2016-F&EA dated 22.11.2016
62nd 301-30/2016-F&EA dated 27.12.2016
63rd 312-1/2017-F&EA dated 16.02.2018
64th 301-20/2018-F&EA dated 24.09.2018
65th 301-03/2020-F&EA dated 03.06.2020
66th C-3/7/(5)/2021-FEA-1 dated 27.01.2022
67th C-3/7/(5)/2021-FEA-1 dated 31.03.2022
68th C/(5)/2021-FEA-1I dated 07.04.2022
69th C/(2)/2021-FEA-I dated 06.12.2022

Note 2.— The Explanatory Memorandum explains the objects and reasons for the Telecommunication Tariff
(Seventieth Amendment) Order, 2024.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

A) Introduction and Background:

1.

The Authority had conducted a Consumer Survey between September 2022 to November 2022, in respect of
Tariffs of Telecommunication Services and related issues with the objective to understand:

e the consumer views on evolution of tariffs per se;
o the efficacy of consumer protection regulations included in the Tariff Order;

o the efficacy of transparency framework in publishing of tariff offers in advertisement give
n by the Telecom Service Provider (TSP).

Based on feedback from consumers, TSPs, associations, and other stakeholders, TRAI released a consultation
paper on July 26, 2024, to review the Telecom Consumer Protection Regulations (TCPR), 2012. The said
paper specifically addresses the validity of vouchers, exploring the need to review the current ninety (90) day
cap on Special Tariff Vouchers (STV) and Combo Vouchers (CV) and to assess if specific consumer
segments might benefit from extended validity for STVs and CVs.

B) Response from the stakeholders:

1.

A total of 41 comments and 5 counter-comments were received in response to the consultation paper,
representing associations, TSPs, individuals, and consumer groups. These comments are publicly accessible
on the TRAI website. An online Open House Discussion (OHD) was held on October 21, 2024, with
participation from various stakeholders. Additional feedbacks were also received after the OHD.

On the issue of extending the validity of STV and CV, most stakeholders favoured extending the
cap beyond the current ninety (90) days. TSPs argued that the ninety (90) day cap is outdated given
the evolving telecom landscape, and many agreed that longer validity would save consumers from
frequent recharges.

After considering views of stakeholders and the existing provisions that allows data-only
packs, the Authority has decided to extend the validity cap for STV and CV from ninety (90)
days to three hundred and sixty-five (365) days. The longer duration recharges of up to three
hundred and sixty-five (365) days will obviate the need of frequent recharges. However,
service providers may offer shorter validity packs, if desired.

VIJAY KUMAR, Advisor (F&EA)
[ADVT -111/4/Exty./846/2024-25]

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.

GORAKHA NATH
YADAVA




		2024-12-30T16:21:21+0530
	GORAKHA NATH YADAVA




