TR &, §.ue.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

Or.5M.-31.Te1.-31.-30122024-259712
CG-DL-E-30122024-259712

SFATYTIOT
EXTRAORDINARY

AT | 1—Evs 4
PART Il1—Section 4

TR & THTIAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

§. 1028] 7E feeeft, WTeraT<, fR|waIT 24, 2024/97W 3, 1946
No. 1028] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, DECEMBER 24, 2024/PAUSHA 3, 1946

ARA qrE=R At sfgemr
1L
¢ Reeft, 23 Ry, 2024

AT ATGSH-13/1/(1)/2023-TER-HE T-| —ATA T Tre=1 FAfFamae stersr stfafags, 1997
(1997 =T 24) FT &7 11 FT ITLUTT (1) F @< (@) F ITEE (i) 30T (v) F I 9fSq &1 36 F favia e
AfFAT FT TART Fd gU, AT THATE AT STieeor, gra=r v @ &afagw, 2012
(2012 T 2) | HeMe" FX gq HATEd [A=aH Jb7aT 8, FATd:-

TLEATT ST IHT GL&07 (FTCgat wener) fafaaw, 2024
(2024 =7 08)

1. (1) =4 RAAIHET F TEATT START G207 (Fgar aare) ===, 2024 Fz7 ST,

(2) T AT T | Ik THT9H AT A & A1 2T & 978 AR i
2. TTEA ITATH H2eq0 fAf=aH, 2012 (2012 &7 2) (399 =84 T4Td g AHIH F31 F10M) F
fafaTw 2 #, g (0) 7, “Tea f&7” 911 % w1 92 ‘i |7 Fue T e wioenfua o s
3. g1 fafv=w & A 4 7, su-ff=aw (2) #;

(F) @ (F) |, T-GE (iv) geT a7 JT0AI;

8308 G1/2024 )



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

(@) @< (@) ¥, $u-g< (v) gaT faar s,
(M @@= (M,
(i) IT-GuUe (jii) 7, "o faT" oreaT F T 4T, " €Y GHe fam" orex wiawatg o
ST,
(iy  ST-mue (i) §, T TT=E F oE Mt awegs s G s,
ERIEE
"ot g off sTarem & 5 FET y=rar Few w9 & atae & vquaug F v s w
F0 U FOw R as=Ee yww won S Jyar sata &9 9 gue ar
srfers gl grin”
(i)  3I-=ve (vi) g feT STus;

(=) =T (F)H, UEe (v) g2 fTmr smom
4. g1 fafa=at & @t 5 &1 ger fa=r s

feoquft 1.- g= FAfFae (FEE=m SusR |@ver fafaaw, 2012), i 06 s=adt, 2012, Afeg=ar der
308-5/2011-FLATTH & HATAH | fadAi® 06 AAa<t, 2012 FT A & TS, AT, AT I, T 4 §
SRS g3 AT

feoqofy 2. — g fafaaw (Fze=me SwsRT sweqr fafaam, 2012), Fr stfeg=mT ge1r 308-5/2011-F:= 0
FIRT "erttera AT AT T foqi 11 S9ad, 2012 &1 9T & 509, TETER, 97 |, @< 4 H T
[ERIRIE

feoquit.3. - g1 A (ET= ITdrRT geanr FfFam, 2012) #1 srfeEaT @ear 308-5/2011-Fg=0g
ZTRT |erTterd AT T 9T AT 21 wair, 2012 F 9 & TS9O, AT, 90 1, T 4, H JHwea
[ERIRIE

feoquit 4. - g1 A (EE= TR geanr FfFaE, 2012) F1 sfeEaT @edr 308-5/2011-Fg:0g
ZTT Fontera R = o7 2= 07 919, 2012 7 9d F TS0, FETLT0T, A7 1, T 4, § T
T

feoquft.5. - g1 A (ET= ITdRT geanr FfFam, 2012) F1 srfeEaT @edr 308-5/2011-Fg:0g
FIET |erTtera TR T Jo i 22 sraea™, 2012 F 91d & TS, STETLT, AT |, @< 4 # Yo
T T

feoquit.6. - g1 A= (TT=Te ITdrRT geanr FfFam, 2012) F1 srfeEaT d@ear 308-5/2011-Fg=0g
ZTT Ferrtera AT AT qor feqis 27 q997, 2012 F1 AT F TS0, STETET0T, A0 |1, G 4 § gahriorg
[ERIRIE

feoqoft.7. - g=r R (g= SwaRT s fafaTs, 2012) Fr stfeg=ET sear 308-5/2011-F= g
ZTT Herrtara =T 3 T o 21 ®Tat, 2013 T AT & T0ST9=, AT, AT 1, T 4 § Thriora
[ERIRIE




[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 3

feoqeft 8. — g1 fAffew (gre=me SR "eerr faffw, 2012) #r srfar=mT dwear 308-3/2012-Fg0
T "errfara fohar a7 qor faaiesw 3 famew, 2013 F7 9a & TS, T, 907 11|, G2 4 | i
T T

frmquit.9. — gor At (Fxa=m SRRt "2ervr faaw, 2012) Fr srfeg=ar @ear 308-1/2015-Fg0d
T Fenfera faT = qur fRFTE 7 3Fred, 2015 ¥ 9T F T, A|TET, A 1, @ 4§y
T T

feogefy.10. - qa EIRRE] (TEAR IuIRT gveqor fafaem, 2012) #r ﬂ'ﬁa’iﬁﬂT g=qT 301-23/2015-T%
UT $U g7 gerrterd R wam a9T fIiE 16 st#gay, 2015 &1 AT & TSI, SFErdmr, 9 |1, g2 4 §
FERIR GRERIRIDT

feoqoft. 1. - q=r e (EEE=T ST sver e, 2012) & sfaeEaT ser 301-7(2)/2015-T%
uT U g genfera T T 9ur fRATE 19 e, 2016 FT 9T o TSI, FETLTr, 9T I, g 4 H
EENIR GRERIRIDIT

ferooft. 12.- g7 R (ETE= ST ST [AfRe, 2012) it sfeEeT @=ar 301-20/2020-UF U
U T gentera fhar = o fGars 30 Frdew, 2020 T 9d & SO, FETERr, 9, @€ 4 §
EERIR GRERIRIDIT

feroquit. 13 - =TT T THATY STAHT G0 (Fgar dered) AT, 2024 (8 #T 2024) +
IZTT 3T FHILUT T SATEAT FaT gl

SATEATHH AT
%. TEATEAT S TS

1. IS F fdae 2022 & Faa¥ 2022 F @19 THATE qAT3Al & SRF T FGi9q qal & qaeg 7
T ITHITHT T AT ohaT AT, ToreehT Sgex ag 3= o7 &

o AT H IRF F fATe 9% IUIRTRAT F FF=E

o I IR | oIS IUHTRT @eervy AfRawT i waraefieran

o NH ATHT F WHTUE ¥ THEATT FAT Y&TaT (SuedY) g7 & 70 BF e § aafear e i
ERIENIE G

2. ITATHTSA T TEATL HAT TETAT (STTHAT) ST I FHI 3AM1< Aigd (A Gagmani ¥ 919 freds %
AT IT, ATEETT 7 &A1 26 [T, 2024 T TTHATT STAHT S0 fAfaaw (Sdiem), 2012 &t

THTAT Fq TH TIHET T ST AT T8 a2wel 0 Aeterterd sq@ o=t 9 gated &
o H IYASYAT FT fAsheq: THATT FAT TETAT (STTHAUT) FRT TAAE § TS Fl S ATAT F2F

TeTRETT ST, o1 ATRAT, ATHIT &1 § g ATl AN alfe St faferg &t & forw gores
FIAH AT THUHTH AT TAT T ST AT il SA9AHAT T TdqT AT
o TSI &t FeaT: o TRE are=T (TEdtdY) F Suar stafer £ axfver wea it sraeaEar F7 aar
T, ST AqATT | 90 AT T HIHT g ST T2 Todishd AT [ 47 UH [&AfUg ST @< &
ST farery S ars= (TEEET) ST wiwr arsa7 (H1aT) & o St aear safer F Ararfead g
o IS il FAT HISIT: TAHT TGLT | T AAATSA ATSAL ATeF TATT &, AT AT ATIAL hl

[ AT T ITERRAT 7 TqT 9T 37 78 fF FreET B Fa7 SUihT gl sz eogdar sz %
forw RfSes d1e & w7 FIET ¢ & S T gl




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

TSI T JeAGW: qqHTT fafd § gl ar3=¥ &1 A-ATS [Sfored qIE F qreqq 7 fHFam S g,

FAA (T AT ATIAL & 70 T10/- 3T IHb ORI & oA I SIETT FLA i TTHRIRAT T Tl
FTET AT Tg Y a1 T fo6 7 |a w=rar 7 e & &9 § Gt off geaast & asft v &
FATSAL %hT TLHIT T SATATT &T ST Thcll Bl

q. QAT g9t qe;
squrﬁ%ﬁm%waﬁw%@ﬁaﬁ%ﬁﬂ%r@w

Vi.

Vii.

viii.

FLEAT FGT YETATsH FIT 99T il ST ATAT TG S ASATE ITHHTSA, 69T &7 7 gt
xRt T T fAsRaTet 3 ST e F 9T R WA @Al 32 FUAT IS % qr THH e
EELL

FAT FedATZa] hl (AT STTTFHATA T T F2A Z AT AT THUHUH AT T F o7 e
ST FTSTATAL T ATFTLTHAT &1 FAAT FHTLOT Flgd THHT =T FqT0)

FT ITATRTSA o T Ao 2w are=e (TadiE) 3 FwivEr arsaY (HiE) @it sTfaeay Jear
FETE JATHT AT U? FAAT T ITAL Bl HI Higd €T FY |

77 U fafore sader o € e e 3w arsae (TadE) siw st g (@i =) F o
AT FLAT AT F ATATAT g2 FAAT T Figd AT STATT T F |

FATE TRgeT #, Tt S Wifds ars=Y 999 & TS qT39L HT AT AT F: 2 2l
AT ars=e it Fere R Frat s 82 Foar wor affd soer stz aard)

FAT STAIRT i AT ¥ Tr2ar #7 Jga€ a7+ F orw (ffvea 9 § Fow #1Ew = fr o
TqHAT &2 FIAT AT IAL I T Algd 3T qqr|

Faa Rafa § gt ars=w &1 R=rs e dre & Areaw & Far Sar g, #7 w3 2T 17
AT & foIT 10/~ 3T IHH TUIRT AT AT FA 1 s ATHREERAT g1 FIAT FOM qfgd
THHT AT Tary)

FAT HAT TETAT T TE6E o SATHTE Tohelt AT Fogast & qeft T o ATSaL 99T FH ol SAATT &f ST

Tl §? FIAT T Aigd T =T Faru|

LA ECEIREARC I IAS CICH

AL T AT H HHI, qIEAR HAT Y& (SUEd), ARRAT S STHAHT ThTerd GHa! 1 e
T AT Ragmawt g7 T 41 fewfomt sfiw 05 afa-feeaforat ama g, S ATgadT & aadrse 9w
qrastia SHF # 3uaed g1 3 7® 21-10-2024 7 TF AT Gt 59 FA7 (ATTAST) AT a0l T
e f[Ates Raament 7 sTa=T agariRar <11 A\areT gar 59 9=1 (A0FST) & T4, T8 Gadran 4
feeafort o g g2

1. TR Iqersgar &t .

1.1 Ragrent & = it afier #39 F 797d, T8 91T T=47 F a6 siY tHuHuE fad arsaY &
ATASTAT FT % ATHS H S0adT (00T FT GIEHT) AT STHAHT TMSAI/ZHAT o o9 TI8 AaHS
2T gl Fad SUHUATS AT BIgHT 0EAT 9 JAF T 3T THUHU qr3=¢ #7 F2re FFar g, &t
STHITHT TS MY ST 1<k T TR T TISIATSA o6 TeT § g

1.2 FaT F1AE 3T THUHUH F forw st Ty wae ¥ oo fT=w fwf

feforte

Wd I TR o



[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 5

i. TEAeerar (Fiaee) FT "isET T I @ AT AT

ii. goreF AT 3T THUHUS qr39Y 2T UM hT ThERAT 9 g1 STt =it g 9 (S
ATz =TS, Tfters arfe) Saswren & fore agat 2 & a8 Rives 2t sriwa S+t
TLFHTE FT Tl 6 T 2

1.3 I¥F A9 ¥ THUHUH 139 @ & &7 § 3370 v foig Aeferfea o sramia o

i. T AT 3T THUHUE qTS9< o UTgahi 37 (erT =9 & ATHor &5 § T a1 A0 o for
g givl

ii. STHTHTSAT T T T TR gAT AT

iii. T AT ST THUATH A8 A1AH Higd STANHATAT I STl I T FLA, ANTT TATEAT
AT, AHATIT T ATHAT AT AT AT S8 ATHHT TEAAT o6 FHILIT ATHRET BT

iv. 3T FAE ST THUHATH ATS9Y 39 STTRTRATAT ! HaT FHLAT g ST A1AE HATL Tl ITATHHAT <o
2, ST qiaemstt & 51 AR TA7ET FHIETE I8 Fd 8, SH THE A6l THE Hl q3 aqTd &
SfI¥ STTTHRAT 6T TS T T=TT 2

v. e =0 & T = § F W S-A1eAr & F0T e AT SeT HAT T SUART FIA & A FHH
TogH 2|

Vi.TT ® gigde @ arel IRET &1 UAET It grav g o 227 % forw Rt #war sfafias arer € &
Iee, UET HAT & o0 ST F3AT I=qT @ Srehl Svg Aaedqshal 95! gl

vii. 9, T, srEdrar 9w i Rre anfe § fIw wu dsfied draree daet F Gy gty e F
T ataw &t THUHTE arsaT i AaTRdT gl g, [HUURT a9 99 Usiighd "iEed qa7
IUANTHRAT T ITATHF FG< T 2T

ST & Afd e, Bt TE=m #ar yararet (Eroadt) § s 60 70 Aiwei § 78 A9 eal ¢ 14 T
T UF Fgea@ ol a1 ATAT TR 150 FHferas geasmreas 9972 & o7 F=e ®iF 9% 93097 F:33d g1 T8 99

AT THUHTH-ATAT AT T [ALqT T AT IATAT g, FAR =T STTNHATAT Hl & & & TS
TIEATT HATSN ATHT hael AFE A TAUHUH il AFeTHAT gial gl
1.4 AU FETOMHAT

AT | U TLHAT HAT T&TAT, TRATTH g ST I TeHFwISal 6 (10 el AT T e
THUHRUH T &1 FLdT 2

FATLT H TTHIVMR TF 7T LEATL AT TTAT & ST STAT-3TT AT AT & (0 haer e
AT Fael THUHUH T T9 FAT Bl

AT, T ToT AHTHT H T EATE HaT TETAT 8, ST AT Tedamisail & (o0 [Hee TaHredi 37
T THUAUH U o FeeH (dehed & d19 T S TISHT T&T9 FdTl gl

IRt H U @ e 9aT Y&TdT, SA [T 8, ST At g raeasharsit w QT F3 aq
A= T3 & ST YT AT gl A Had AT Y FAd THUHUH WA ATHA g, a1 &f
ST FAFETEE X UF Tedde SUINT FAgeie? 9l g, ST STANHATSAT Hl IAh! ALTHAT %
AT 9T T 3T TAT I 9T FA § I, T&AH F47qT &l




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

o UTfREQTH H U 7T LEATE HAT T&TAT, THIA g, ST had J199 FATA ¥ AT 3T TqUauy
AT 3 HATSI o oIy & J&T F:2ar gl

1.5 ST & AT § T@d gu, Raemai & o= o gaian daaigi Fayvre! ¢ fF= #3 F 978,
TR 7 A= g T AiS@Er Ser-9haa TeET 3T dSd A 6 ATk Uk ST qiag i
THUHRUS HT iAefod £t J ARl ag fF T|r = ¢ F Fae 99 $iY uHueus s 6
ATATAT FIA T IT TohT2a<] T Ueh Tashed o, v ST it saeasnar 981 g 3 a8 fBreft off
TE H 2T THTAMT i TR I8 7 g T2 FO F90i 0 Fa7 21471 a5 ATHT 3 Faol 27
TS T TR FIA % (o7 T 2|

2. TSI I JEAT:

2.1 TEEAT ST W= Y AT T T G AT q2 F daer H, FaAT yGrqret qtgd afgrawter Faamew 90
3T ¥ T H9T | AR T9ar q@T F 96 ° o) St i 06T § 6 aged ahged § aear
FT AT 3t ITEE AL T T E) TEH o uwHa 0 o ©F Sear safar g & sushre
T ATE-aTC AT e T TLATHT & Tgd Ao

2.2 RBaegmht & greaon 9% G F3 ofiT E=r STHH 93 (F9at genrge) &=, 2016
ETT Y& ST Had e =l J9dr & 365 &AT T *F Hi@r Tad & Hedsd TEIw w1 T8
AT g T Faer 1 9% i Jear & SIqa g1 UHerAl i HidT dr Fear T & ad e 90

oAt & g 365 foe o ST =R w78t 7g e ot S AR u o Sear dir i age
T AAAS HAT TETAT3N I SIS TEAT T TLT Il | AT Al 2l

3. IR FAL HIST:
3.1 ATIAT il FAT HITST X e HIS H FAL AT F HLA 6 ATAA H, TR TraaAr=m
HTAAT o7 T SIS & AFATsd ATST & TgeT § Fid? RIS AUTHRE gl T2 g 3 SHoT
Alta a1 RRree A # T8l Aaedhal Tgi gl
3.2 T HT WX ITAT HAHHHT A=A F A § T@d gU, IEH & 7 g [ ars=<i &l Fag
TSN &l TATH F T ST ATRU

4, AL HT oI
4.1 FFA ST-3TT AT & ToIT T10/- TAT THeh ORI o6 T T SALIerd L@ JAT FAT THT TR

F FrsaY Tt off goeaeat § JU ST 96 §, % 918 |, SATeenier IaATRe w7 /7T o7 & =9
TIE W D GATH AT ST THaT &, T S(9-3TT ATSAL FT TINT Fgd FH 64T 1Al § 3T
T & AT THTE F AT oAt ofF Fogast & ver o0 ST 9ahd &, F01h Siotehe SAqere -aTsf
STTersh AT g1 MU | THE TATAT, Hdd 27 T AT3AL & o107 I10/- 3T I8 U o Tedat
FT AT FA o FHT TA(Id qa&T TRade & T2 U 0 § AT TERE Jal 8, Sl (efoed
AT TG 2|

4.2 I X o= F2d gu, TIieseor &1 F= g 6 Fae ef0-o17 ars=e & o 10/- 90 37 39+
TUTRT o AN &l ST il sl ATEAT THTH FT &l AT AT QT AT TLHATT TAT TETATS T
ST THE o Tohell T GAas T § T AT T&TT e ol QAT &f ST AT, et gLEATT
S aer (SIETer) (50aT werrerd) saer 2012 T 10 F9T qodaw & &H § 7 UH (q-377T
TS ATARLT T TATAT TGT AT AT




[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 7

TeT #, Raamei & v Sarar o7 Gfre STHhT sraeawarst w1 A § T@d gu, 39 el T T

g forg o ot A &

i. A 3T THUHTT ¥ U eent uad-arsae afasfad AT THE ISRl i qevy ®9 F
ST SATF9TF ATl % o7 AT e &7 fashed I R 77 209 (39w &9 § ITARAE % 79
i, fasrosn gept safRa, arior e § YEA ATl AR ST FrEY BT STARTERATer w1 ard e

i, TEEET $i7 " 3 T Serar srafar i wisEr 90 At fr AT Fr FErwe 365 faw AT s =R,

ST o Fad T AL Al JeAT % AET &, FA(1h SqH STARIA il JE-ATL AT HLT hl
e & qfth et

jii. AT =TSN T THEAT &1 19 | T@d g0 AT 0l WITddh & § HIS[G 1 HITST ] TATT 64T
ST HRaT 2

iv. AT ZIT-3TT AT & [T T10/- TAT I [UIhHT F oA Tl (6T L@ il SHAGEAT T THTT T
ST TR T g AT SITAAT &1 AIAT T80 & et I qogast § G997 89T Ia™ Fid 6l SIqAtd af oI
qFHAT g, STateh Srerar (5037 Herre) sraer 2012 T Y& 10/- TeFad & &7 F FH UH q-377T
TS 6 ATHILT Tl TR T@T ST ThdT g

FEATHI: Tg TLHATT STATTHT HLA (Fgar gerge) AfHaw, 2024 97 €9 | s # @ 10 76=w
STHAIHT T2 (Fgar derred) fafaaw, 2024 #1 Bat srqare g1 T off et & 9@ o, RSt |
foraT AT EATT ITAHT L& (Fgar gerrge) A=aw, 2024 917 g

AL FHTC ATe, =
[fa=TTa=-111/4/3197./845/2024-25]

TELECOM REGULATORY AUTHORITY OF INDIA

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, 23 December, 2024
No. RG-13/1/(1)/2023-ADV_ FEA-I ---- In exercise of the powers conferred upon it under
section 36, read with sub-clauses (i) and (v) of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 11, of the Telecom
Regulatory Authority of India Act, 1997 (24 of 1997), the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India hereby
makes the following regulations further to amend the Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 (2
of 2012), namely:-

TELECOM CONSUMERS PROTECTION (TWELFTH AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 2024
(08 of 2024)

1. (1) These regulations may be called the Telecom Consumers Protection (Twelfth Amendment)
Regulations, 2024;



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

(2) They shall come into force after thirty days from the date of their publication in the Official
Gazette.

2. In regulation 2 of the Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 (2 of 2012) (hereinafter
referred to as the “principal regulations”), in clause (ca), for the words “ninety days”, the words

“three hundred and sixty-five days” shall be substituted.

3. Inregulation 4 of the principal regulations, in sub-regulation (2) —
(@) inclause (a), sub-clause (iv) shall be deleted,;
(b) inclause (b), sub-clause (v) shall be deleted:;
() inclause (c) -
(i) in sub-clause (iii) for the words “ninety days”, the words “three hundred and
sixty-five days” shall be substituted;
(i)  in sub-clause (iii), after the third proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely-
“Provided also that the service provider shall offer at least one Special
Tariff Voucher exclusively for Voice and SMS with validity period not
exceeding three hundred and sixty-five days”.
(iii) sub-clause (vi) shall be deleted,;

(d) inclause (d), sub-clause (v) shall be deleted.
4. Regulation 5 of the principal regulations shall be deleted.

Note.1. - The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were published in the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part Il1l, Section 4 dated the 6" January, 2012 vide notification number No. 308-5/2011-
QOS dated the 6" January, 2012.

Note.2. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were amended vide Notification No.308-
5/2011-QOS and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4 dated the 11" January,
2012.

Note.3. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
N0.308-5/2011-Q0S and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il1, Section 4 dated the 21%
February, 2012.

Note.4. - The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
N0.308-5/2011-QOS and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4 dated the 7"
March, 2012,



[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 9

Note. 5. -The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
No0.308-5/2011-QOS and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4 dated the 22"
October, 2012.

Note.6. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
N0.308-5/2011-QOS and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Ill, Section 4 dated the 27"
November, 2012.

Note.7. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
N0.308-5/2011-QOS and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4 dated the 21%
February, 2013.

Note.8. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
No0.308-3/2012-QOS and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Ill, Section 4 dated the 3™
December, 2013.

Note.9. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
No0.308-1/2015-Q0S and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part I1l, Section 4 dated the 7
August, 2015.

Note.10. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
N0.301-23/2015-F&EA and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4 dated the
16" October, 2015.

Note.11. — The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
N0.301-7(2)/2015- F&EA and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4 dated the
19™ August, 2016.

Note. 12.- The Telecom Consumers Protection Regulations, 2012 were further amended vide Notification
No. 301-20/2020-F&EA and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part 111, Section 4 dated the
30" September, 2020.

Note.13 — The Explanatory Memorandum explains the objects and reasons of the Telecom Consumers
Protection (Twelfth Amendment) Regulations, 2024 (08 of 2024).

Explanatory Memorandum

A. Introduction and Background:

1. The Authority had conducted a consumer survey between September 2022 to November 2022
in respect of Tariffs of Telecommunication Services and related issues with the objective to
understand:

e the consumer views on evolution of tariffs per se;
o the efficacy of consumer protection regulations included in the Tariff Order;
o the efficacy of transparency framework in publishing of tariff offers or in advertisement

given by the Telecom Service Provider (TSP).



10

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

2. Based on the feedback received from consumers and various stakeholders including TSPs and
their associations, etc. TRAI issued a consultation paper on review of Telecom Consumer
Protection Regulations (TCPR) 2012 on July 26, 2024. The paper deals with the following key

areas:

e Choice of Tariff Availability: To explore the requirement of separate Voice
and SMS plan, and separate data plans tailored to specific segments like elderly
persons, people residing in rural areas etc. in addition to bundled offerings
presently provided by TSP’s.

o Validity of vouchers: To explore the need for reviewing the validity period of
Special Tariff Vouchers (STV) which is presently capped at ninety (90) days and
to assess whether there are specific consumer segments that would benefit from
longer validity periods for Special Tariff Vouchers (STVs) and Combo Vouchers
(CVs).

e Colour coding of vouchers: To explore the relevance of colour coding of physical
vouchers in present scenario when online vouchers are more prevalent and also
whether colour coding can be introduced in digital mode to enhance consumer
convenience and clarity.

e Denomination of vouchers: To explore the relevance of reserving denomination
of 210/- and multiple thereof only for Top up Vouchers in the present situation
where re-charge of vouchers is carried out through the digital mode and also
whether all types of vouchers can be allowed to be offered in any denomination of

the choice of service provider.

B. Consultation Issues:
The paper posed the following issues for consideration before the stakeholders:
i. How do current tariff plans offered by telecom service providers align with the preferences and

usage patterns of consumers, particularly elderly individuals? Please justify with rationale.

ii. Is there a need for separate plans for Voice & SMS and data to meet the specific requirements

of subscribers. Please justify with reasons.

iii. Whether the maximum validity of Special Tariff Vouchers (STVs) and Combo Vouchers (CV5s)
for consumers should be increased? Please Justify your response with reasons.

iv. Are there specific consumer segments that would benefit from longer validity periods for
Special Tariff Vouchers (STVs) and Combo Vouchers (CVs)? Please justify along with

rationale.



[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 11

v. In the current scenario, where dealers are doing recharge of vouchers online instead of selling
physical vouchers. How relevant is colour coding of physical vouchers? Please justify with
reasons.

vi. Whether colour coding can be introduced in digital mode to enhance consumer convenience and
clarity? Please Justify your response with rationale.

vii. In the present situation where recharge of vouchers is carried out through digital mode, is there
any relevance of reserving denomination of X10/- and multiple thereof only for Top up
Vouchers. Please Justify with reasons.

viii. Whether all types of vouchers can be allowed to be offered in any denomination of the choice of

service provider? Please Justify along with rationale.

C. Response from the stakeholders:
In response to consultation paper, a total of 41 comments and 05 counter-comments by stakeholders
representing associations, TSPs, individuals and Consumer Advocacy groups were received which
are available in public domain on the TRAI website. There was an online Open House Discussion
(OHD) held on 21-10-2024 in which various stakeholders participated. Post online OHD, comments
of stakeholders were also received.

1. Choice of Tariff Availability:

1.1 On reviewing the views of stakeholders, it is noted that there has been a clear-cut divide of
opinion between the TSPs (except BSNL) and consumer organisations/individuals on the
matter of mandating of Voice & SMS only vouchers. The TSPs except for BSNL have
opposed separate Voice & SMS only packs while the consumer organisations and other

individuals have come in favour of these types of vouchers.

1.2 The views against having separate VVoice & SMS only vouchers were based on the following:
i. The existing policy of forbearance should be continued with.

ii. Separate Voice & SMS vouchers would reverse data inclusion as it is critical for

consumers today (like online re-charges, UPI etc) and in-line with initiatives by the

Government like the Digital India programme.

1.3 The points raised in favour of having separate Voice & SMS vouchers were based on the
following:
i Separate Voice & SMS only vouchers would be helpful for the elderly customers
and especially those living in rural areas.

ii. Consumers must have right to choice.



12

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

14

1.5

Vi.

Vii.

Separate Voice and SMS only vouchers would be beneficial on account of varied
aspects like catering to voice centric users, cost effective plans, flexibility &
customization and market segmentation.

Separate Voice and SMS vouchers cater to users who prioritize voice
communication, offering a cost-effective solution without data features, thus
simplifying their choices and enhancing user satisfaction.

Elder people are lesser inclined to use data services due to lack of knowledge
especially in rural areas.

Families having broadband at home feel that recharging for data is extra burden and
forcing them to pay for services which is not required.

For getting OTP from registered mobile numbers given in Banks, Aadhar, ITR
filling report etc, Voice and SMS packs are required especially when registered mobile

number is not the primary number of user.

Apart from above, data collected from various Telecom Service Providers (TSPs) reveals
that still a significant segment i.e. about 150 million subscribers continues to rely on
feature phones for communication. This indicates an ongoing demand for Voice and SMS-
only plans, as these users primarily require basic telecommunication services viz. only
Voice and SMS.

International Practices:

Banglalink, a telecom service provider in Bangladesh, offers Voice-only and SMS only
packs for their subscribers.

Grameenphone, another telecom service provider in Bangladesh also offers Voice-only and
SMS only packs for different validity periods.

Tello, a telecom service provider in United States, offers a tariff plan with custom choice
of minute units and free SMS packs for their subscribers.

Telenor, a leading telecom service provider in Pakistan, offers a variety of packages to
meet diverse customer needs. These include Voice-only and SMS-only plans, as well as an
internet usage calculator on their website, enabling users to select the most suitable plans
based on their requirements.

Ufone, another telecom service provider in Pakistan offers tariffs for VVoice only services,

and combination of VVoice and SMS services.

In view of the above, after going through the views of stakeholders and best international
practices, the Authority is of the view that a separate STV for Voice and SMS in addition

to existing Data only STV and bundled offers shall be mandated. It is also observed that



[9TT HH—=vE 4] T T TSI © T 13

2. Vali
2.1

2.2

3.
3.1

3.2

4.1

mandating Voice and SMS only STV will provide an option to subscribers who do not
require data and this in anyway will not reverse the government initiative of data inclusion

as service providers are at liberty to offer bundled offers and data only vouchers.

dity of Vouchers:
With respect to the issue related to extending the validity of STV and CV, most of the
stakeholders including service providers were in favour of extending the validity of beyond
the present cap of ninety (90) days. The TSPs felt that in the changing landscape, the cap on
validity is no longer relevant. There was almost unanimous view that extension of validity

period would benefit consumers from the hassle of frequent re-charges.

The authority after going through the views of stakeholders and keeping in view the existing
provision of validity of Data only packs up to three hundred and sixty-five (365) days provided
by Telecom Consumers Protection (Tenth Amendment) Regulations, 2016, is of the opinion
that in sync with validity of Data only packs, the cap on validity of STV and CV be extended
from present ninety (90) days to three hundred and sixty-five (365) days. Here it is to be noted
that increasing the cap on validity is no way prohibiting service providers to offer smaller
validity packs.

Colour coding of Vouchers:
On the matter of colour coding of vouchers and introducing colour coding in the digital mode,
most of the participants were of the view that colour coding has become irrelevant in today’s

scenario of online recharge and is therefore not required either in the physical or digital mode.

In view of above unanimous view on the issue, Authority is of the opinion that colour coding of

vouchers be done away with.

Denomination of VVouchers:
In the matter of reserving denomination of X10/- and multiple thereof only for Top up vouchers
and whether all types of vouchers can be offered in any denomination, most participants were of
the view that such distinction can be done away with as miniscule re-charges happen for top-up
vouchers and also that all types of vouchers can be offered in any denomination as online re-
charges have become more common nowadays. Moreover, the issues of currency change
prevalent at the time of reserving denomination of Z10/- and multiple thereof only for Top up

vouchers are not of much relevance in an era where digital transactions are prominent.



14

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I1I—SEC.4]

4.2 Considering above, the Authority is of the view that reserving of denomination of 10/- and

multiple thereof only for top-up voucher be done away with and TSPs may be allowed to offer

all the vouchers in any denomination of their choice while retaining mandate of at least one Top

Up voucher of denomination of 210/- provided by Telecommunication Tariff Order (TTO) (50%"
amendment) Order 2012.

D. Conclusion

To summarize, in view of the responses from stakeholders and in view of the specific consumer

requirements, the Authority has decided the following:

To mandate a separate STV for Voice & SMS. This would give consumers an option to

pay for the services they require in general and in particular benefit certain segments of
consumers especially the elderly persons, those living in rural areas and feature phone
users.

The cap on validity period for STV and CV be increased from existing ninety (90) days
to three hundred and sixty-five (365) days in line with validity of data only vouchers as
this would benefit consumers from the hassles of frequent re-charge.

Colour coding of vouchers as it exists in the physical form be done away with in view of
the prominence of online re-charges.

The reserving of denomination of X10/- and multiple thereof only for top-up voucher be
done away with and TSPs may be allowed to offer all the vouchers in any denomination
of their choice while retaining mandate of at least one Top Up voucher of denomination
of 10/- provided by TTO (50" amendment) order 2012.

ATUL KUMAR CHAUDHARY, Secy.
[ADVT .- 11/4/Exty./845/2024-25]

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.

GORAKHANATH  ogtan
YADAVA 2




		2024-12-30T16:22:44+0530
	GORAKHA NATH YADAVA




