I 4. ST.u.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Rd & a59A
Che Gazette of India

Gr.5M.-31.Te1.-31.-19122023-250757
CG-DL-E-19122023-250757

SEIEI)
EXTRAORDINARY

AW | 1—EvE 4
PART Il1—Section 4

grfeTe T TFIfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 840] 7% ey, WoreraTe, fawT 19, 2023/3WgT 28, 1945
No. 840] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, DECEMBER 19, 2023/AGRAHAYANA 28, 1945

orferaw i yrpfas 49 s 9
CIPECET
% feeety, 18 fewwaw, 2023

B, §. froashsmt/ate./3-frdrfiuar (06)/2022.—32rforaw siv wyrafas dw s e afefam,
2006 (2006 FT 19) T &T=T 61 FET T& RN FT TART FXd gU, TEIodH T qTHas 48 GFfeamms ae
Fefoafea EfRaw aamar 2, staiq-

1. gfara e s s, -

(1) == =t = dform i sl 1 s a9 (@@fery o ey S aEueTeT #i
e, fmtor, s=rer = feare #w3 F forg dafat v arfeepa weam) enee fBfaam, 2023 F=r s

(2) T fAfF= ST TSI § TH9E A R " I gl

2. UEferIw i yTHfas o AfAamms e (Yo S Sgiferay 3care areuerea & A, [Ein, s=ree ar
fIreame #3 & forg safaat &t wfdsa war) ===, 2010 +, -

() fafe=w 2 % su-faf=w (1) 4,
(F) < (3) -
(i) "HYS[ET" eTeat % &R, "g" orex TR AT SITUA;
(ii) "ST= ATSA" 9Tsal o AT, "AT T ATSA" 9158 ATHHS {7 IO,

7800 G1/2023 1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I11—SEC.4]

(iii) "ITSTATSA T "9TeR o ATE "TTIEFA" «TE7 TIHA R SO,
(@) &< () #-

(i) TAT TSI 9TeaT "| 0% B AT 3T "gTT HEl9rd SR real & THI g arel 91 % €1
T et wfaearfoa e o, stafq-

(ii)"STHTT AT SAqFY ATEH F T § US[TH T T[TH IATE ATSTAATSA TUTSAT F HATAT &
forT srareTh seTeer giagret F wara afgd”

(M) @@= (T) F v et et s, st -

o "TIT-ATSA" FT AT & AT Rt v T ared ¥ Awe a1 e w3 et areaere g,
et =9 S AWdT g UTSUATSd | ATSE Al g, AThd [SrEH UF AT SATerF IUTIRTAT I
UEITOrIH ST TEIforad SeaTal i I % forg Firg §fusr giaer T g1 BT o aremerea &,
SEH UF AT YSIorw 3T YSITora® 3cITe &d AT UF 99 8, F TI-ATeA & &9 § qgl AMET
STUATT| FOE-ATST Y FdTS 2o ITEaaATe $1 dare 9% A9 921 g1 Thdt g1 Yoy Scamat &
ufvagd & U UF T-ATe & &F qTSUared fi AT H ITAN FIAT AT T AT § FiF
AT o AT &

"(T) "eTS-TA FATFSIAL" FT AT & Uk HTHT ATgeh AT HIAGT ATEH TS| T ISIToraw IeaT
e 3 Aefefag & & Y uvF % &= geromy ST geifoay IeaTal & qieaed & forg
TSI 3T Y2 TH IcATE ITSTATSH Fefaatael, A7 -

(i) Trferay i gerferay 3IoqTe &, A7

(ii) Freft st |THTeT ATEE AT |fEET aTed US| ST YEreray 3TUTE UTSadrsd | Uh

TAT ToFT TATEL |

(@) Affaw 54, -

(F) IT-FAf (1) &, "5 & F0" q51T & FF S AT W F T i Fr9F 7 "(FagiReT afgq) ywew
|iZT" & AT GUTH S AT &l & &1 9 MAtariaa sfaernfia R s, seri;-

"SI 6T JadTEe 9% 38 ATTF T9TE ad gU dag e H3;"
(@) S9-faff=w= (5) ¥ .-

(i) " 7 | FH " qSaT F ¢ g ATl 3T "TASTIA THRTTAT 7" 9Teal |1 HHTH g ATel AT &l
, "Iegree” orex & WiaeATiua fRaT St

(ii) "UErferaT ITUTE UTEuATeA" 958 & a7%, "TUASeEl it qaHTEe U eeal HI ST onHe
ST,
(iii) 3u-fafe= (9) & =7 F¥ fo=r sSTo=m)
@@ w74, -

(F) ST-Rf{=w (1) .-

(1) &= (%) -
(i) "=7 a9 AT sraty” oreai & v 9 AEtre asg wiaeariog o ST, -
"THF TATAT F &[F g ATeAT TTSTATSH *F ITATHIAT FHTA T Tedah a9,

(il "I AT AT TAF T A F forw A ST, ersat wr g A At worw THe
g % forg e STusfh” ersat & wiaerfoa fBRar s,

(iii) "TETH" ¢Te= F T I "ATAH" 57 AT AT AT ST,




[T lHl—aTE 4] T T TS9O : SHTLTIT 3

() @7 (@) .-

(i) oz "TF AT A FATY" F TE UL, "THF TATAT H F I AT qTSIATST F
IYATHIAT FTA T TAF qU"; 9767 TraeArioa & ST,

(ii), "9 T AT TAF TH qUT 6 (o7 TS SATUIH" raat il "L it qIAT T TH I
FuT = forT emrs STueh” oreat | wiaeriue BT s

(iii) "sfrEr" ereT F TATH U "ATAE" e T TiaeTiua BT ST,
(1) == (1) |, orex "d" F TAT9 9 "SH" 9167 T aeATraa B Sroa;
(@) Su-faf{== (3) # -
i) "So-faffay" ereg o T 9T 9TsT, FTF ST i (1) Fiaeariug Gro s,

(
(i) "HTAT" 95T F TIE UL 5% , FHISF A Fqe¥ " ghoa R o F oo ywarfEe amar
(THTELIT) Fr gfaeerrid B s

(iii) "TRATSAT FT STURAT" AL AT TSI F ATE, A%, HITF AT ATHS, "SH, TTSTATSA HiT
AGTE, SATH, TIL ATA, T TAT YT 3T Y2rforad Scaral it Ireuerey & o s gafaa
gferer, sar 3 rfaaw 2 % so-fEfaaw (1) ¥ 9 (i) F qga afarfua fBm = €, @ siet ST,

() Iu-RAfTw (4) % are, oo ster sme, stfq:-

“(5) 3u-faf=a (1) & @ (F) ¥ (@) F qgd Garferad ¥ I2roay 3care areaares R % forg a1
I T ITEaaTE % T & T8 99 8§ AN g ITSare &l a8 =91 99T ST STa Seeht
F qTSIATSH I a3 AT gl SITUIT| SATAF T & FT Al T2 2 TTSTATSH (oI, Fgel TIH a9 FHT
& T AR ER ST T 6 T8 9 TrEuereA T %8 & |1 Aol gl ATl

(6) TS ITSTATSH & SA(AF S(ad & qTE ATTEHT I HSET -l g 3T qIEAATSA & TATAA hl
QIEATAT AT o 1= %l THT AATE F GLEL AT F o0 IZLT I FT Toedre FAMI”;

(=) AT 12 4, -
(i) 39-fafaeT (1) =7 &7 2 fo= STosm;
(ii) Sw-fafa=w (2) & forw, fMefeatea s sfaeata BT STosm, st -

“(2) gtz gZrferaw siT UErferam ScaTe qrsueTs f SHaT T EEdqT F T4 &7 e 8, 91 FIT are &
= % o U e Yeqa H a9 d1E S H ST UEIerdH ScATE qTeadTed § eHaT & e
#T SIqAfT < FFHaT 81

(iii) Su-fafa=e (2) ¥ are, Feferfad et sosm, sraiq-
“(3) Su-faf=w (2) F Tgd YSrtoraw iT TZrord 31T qT2aaTe | &HdT & faware & gafed s
Tft TEIorTw T Uordad ITITE qTEaared 9T a0 g S a7 ar &Ff==w 4, 18, 19 & dgq & g
srferga € a1 A= 17 & qga w=id & ST 3 g 99 g1 TieFd ¢

Ford o 9IS U yeqriad feede % ®I9 9T afod® €9 F el AH=a &2 6dr g, Ts are
quAar ¢ T et st w § Mot Seedl | | U A7 A8 & I g i, ;-

() FIIFTT # F1 TITETET FT T21aT 7,
(i) fazef® fAaer & a=41;

(i) HTTIG TG T@AT JT FETAT IT FHIT [Fa<or larera #FTar a7 72 &9 § 921Haq7 i
GEIfGTTH IITRT 1 TIIT ITTEAT IAT27T FIAT;

(iv) ST QAT HIT G2HATT 3977 FI297E7 R% 7% 9277 3T 92ifaae 3cqrat #1
SUTEAT & T7H H TTgH % 15l 1 GeIT FIAT;




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I11—SEC.4]

(v) UZITerTH ST GZITerA IS8 TTEaTE ATl @ F q 1 (a0 1 Tredried ",
(=) Bffaw 21 4, -
() i H, "gg™ 7 ARt gqedl F 9TE, "7 IA-TH FAfFRfad AT TOE-ATed fAgmEr oes
FqEiua R SToT;
(iy Sw-fafa=w (1) #,-
() "7 = fiae-" ereat & forw,, et siaearfoa frm somm, stafq; -
Sy ZfEee, AT
(v) TTE-2 FAtFefadr fSrarRe U 73T #q ST, 4T
(vi) T2 =rE famgraT -
(@) EESARER I IENE R ILUIF

@ T (999§, "IEaerEa & e & 978 TEAerEd o § S 97T qal g[ qOeal &
AT 9%, "UH THTE & HIL0T S § FilE G8ATd qal g 1" 68 i &qriaa o ST,

(iii) ST-fafa=w (2), #1 =0 BT stTos;
(iv) 39-fafa=w (3)  forw, Mo & afteefoa fBem srosm, srrr-
“(3) AT TTZSTATEA 6T LHAT T FEATT FIA T T6qTT &, AT HAAT (AHAT 12 F TEETEN F JET TS 6

o= % fore o wwara TEqa HOM ST dIe ISuered g1l a7 Y6 HIA aT qTgehi 9% Tadd T
=T AT arEueTes # Har 9T = w5 F arE, A i aqatd @ 9wt gl

(v) 3u-fafazw (5) % are, Meterfaa sireT ST, st -
°(6) TZrfer| T Yoy ITUTE qTSaaTe &1 (e
(i) AT SIS US| STITET ol TSHeATE i ITEFd dars il 7T Fal § g9 65
77 sifaw foig & == wiaera a1 50 F6.HT., ST AT w7 g1, TF T@7 Gl g ¥ a1 FT J&=19 ®

siif=rer | gt faawor, aft gagrst f =r@r = qa H0 i a9 7 99 ST Ie
T

Ford o FoReT AT ToReTehT THEaT Ieqe gi U%, UITerdd fi¥ 2o 3caTe arsaedres
% UH faeaw & ga &g a7 sifaw b & go &6y § oaqa7 av Meeaw aFaaars o
Fqred (THAT) T & ATIF Tal M, AlhT HAAT HI Theirenl areraqi & foro Hega
=T TR LA T A eTHAT g

(i) T, ATESTAE qIHST F TR, AU ITH g & 918 fadqt & Hiaw Fa«r w1 i awm)
(i) T % are AErferd ST YSroraw STITe TSI &% | IS aadrd el g
(7) 2TE-37 FATFlaa:

(F) Rt JTaTer aTew AT "feeT atgw TSIt ST YSIorIw IcqTE UTSUATSd o T STIeEry
T ladl T ArFeTHAT F AT |, Ftreradt  forw v fregqa seara gafara doet g a1 &
seqd ToRaT StToeT foad |t A1 Serwerd &g qieeed, St F o § ’iSEr YeierEH S
ST ITATE ATSTATST FAATET T Y TEATAT STe-39 T (Fe(aer il dars ¥ &war % q97
HART-AT( SITATH T feraeor g sroam

(@) T fRaamet & = i froafort g ¥ foro arastiae wemst s = w g o et 6
Fafyr 3 forw g&aTa 7 JagIee FIT |

(M) "TESEE g IERAT F S 9T AT e e e F sy uw, 91 39 RBagrewt & A
AT FAT AFST F ThaT g gl e fa=e g7+ 0 2l




[T HHl—ETE 4] T T TSI SHTATIT 5)

(=) = Rufetad agfa % aqam vE arg-2a Fwatratadt w1 SAfadq w7 7har 2, aoiq-
(i) TE-T FATHAET FT AT Fead: ITTE HT AT Soraer f&g F 919 HiSE IHET a8F
T HIEAET ATgS USoIH 3T UIorad ITaTe TSI & ST areit Ha«t greT T
ST, Ford 3 Uy ar$-3a Ftaetadt il ars AT aTgs AT ST arg® darerad
AT UITor IeATE IT2aaTs i ITTEFd Fars e Tiaerd gr, a1 g Afdshan 200 Fr..
g
Ford T ITATE 1 AT T Tog & T JiS(@ UF | ATF TSera| e Gerforasd
ICATE TTEIATE F AU H, HIG F [ehedq ATHTT ATgF a7 Hi9aT a8 deiiorad
AT YT ITUTE UTSIATSH T TTIHE ST HATAT e qTAt FUT T AIfaw
= 7 e S T STE-37 FATHAel [SaT § TAH F2 F1 TaaT ST g,

Ford T afs AT ATEF AT HART ATEH USITorH iT USITeraH IeqT ITeaarsd
T FATIHCT 3T HATAT FX qATeAT FAAAT I STe-3 FATF AT (g T TAHT
FAT &, AT AT IH Togh HUAT T SATHT HT ThdT g [oTd FIHT ST 9rdt F Aq1F
T ATS-TA FATHS AT T AT T Seaqrar f&am o7 i UF 910 §, Togeh AT A7
IO 3T WTHfa T BAfRammT 91 (a1 a1ee AT STaaT argsh GEierdd 37
EITOrIH ITTE qTEuaTesdl & oy ug= s=me dfgan) fafaem, 2016 % @ §
"fOrgT" AT SATUATT;

(ii) are faffw 5 % su-fAfew (5) F waamet F aqaw ge9fdq e waEedr ® o
Frferat st Fe a off o= #% gwar g;

(ii) ST-GEE () § < TS AaT T ATAF 22-39 TLTATSH Feltaerael & Faror & T off seara
T Ffaeaeff Fret AR & forg F=et & JrEiieE el & SqET e S,

(8) TwT-ATA fagm:

T AT o ToIT S0 0% F3 ATl U] T J1S & 99 TIET 6 qTA-H1T TIL-ATSH 6l Ad1s, A,
FHAT S¥ AT Y& 60 ST a7 ATl & a2 & a1 § giod FAT T 3T are STre 979 2 &
75 o1 % HTae HOAT FT AT T 6 F7E TIAT =07 <9

(9) = =@ A= F Jga TEIT VI AT & T I dFcqh & F JIoAT AHET H ghaT §, IS O
ag g9 g & Aifert smifa w0 & Ferfofaa steat § & us ar afgs 6 g} grft, sraiq;-

(i)  @OfET F = TaeadT fi 9gTaT & T,
(i) s fFerer & =,

(i) T FATT TEAT AT FEET AT G Fqer gEATET FAT AT W A F GSOEH T q2orTw
ITATRT T TATH STASEAT AT FEAT,

(iv) 3T Yo ST Yo ScaTe ITeqaTed S 9¥ USITorad Sl YSriorad ScaTal i STeTserdT
* TaW § UTEHI & fZdT il FLeAT FIAT;
(v) TEIferas ST GEferad SeuTe qTedere giaral @ & qia fahre 1 oAtz w7m";
(F) T @ F A0T-11 A, -
() "I AT TR F TATH U "THIH AU 987 WiaeATAd oA ST,
(i) "= 10" orex T Sk F TATA I¥ "W 25" orex 3T i yiaeariod fhu s,

(i) "I T AT F" TeRT H F B AT AT "FITR FE" 51T 9 HHIH g AT T, A AT HAr
STTUAT:




6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I11—SEC.4]

(%) AT TH, -
() o=z "I T F T 9 "IHIE a9 ares wiaearia B S,
(i) ofRt, et sfiT et & forg, "0.50 x TAUHS1 + 0.20 x U1 + 0.30 x U1, 3, e
T AT "0.40 X TATHIT + 0.40 x T4 + 0.20 x T=1" gfaeerfua o s,

(iii) 3fRt, FreAT #fiT i F U, "0.50 x TAUEHA2 + 0.20 x A2 + 0.30 x wHH2" 37, e
T AT "0.40 X TATHI2 + 0.40 x TAATEI2 + 0.20 x U= 2" gfaeerfua o s,

(iv) 3T, oAl ST steAl & T 9T, "0.50 x TATHEST3 + 0.20 x TAATEr3 + 0.30 x UAHI3" 3,
AT 3T rer<l "0.40 x TAUERST 3 + 0.40 x TAa1E13 + 0.20 x T=Hy3" wiaeefua &y srur;

AT 9T, HT
[FAsTTaa-111/4/3197./1623/2023-24]

urg feoquft; gor farfaaw strowsme 722(31), TR 01/09/2010 3 wreaw & srfeegf=a 3 10 o siiw arg § @1, 9. vd-
TS UEHT/VI/1/2007, T 01/01/2015 3fT w18, Srerua/E/03/ddue, amF 29.03.2016
T Hertera fohw w o

PETROLEUM AND NATURAL GAS REGULATORY BOARD
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 18th December, 2023

F.No. PNGRB/Auth/3-PPPL(06)/2022.—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 61 of the
Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory Board Act, 2006 (19 of 2006), the Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory
Board hereby makes the following regulations, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement,-

(1) These regulations may be called the Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory Board (Authorizing Entities to
Lay, Build, Operate or Expand Petroleum and Petroleum Products Pipelines) Amendment Regulations,
2023.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory Board (Authorizing Entities to Lay, Build, Operate or Expand
Petroleum and Petroleum Products Pipelines) Regulations, 2010, -

(a) insub -regulation (1) of regulation 2,-
(A) in Clause (f),-
(i) after, the words “from an existing”, the word “trunk” shall be inserted;
(ii) after, the words, “branch line”, the words “or spur line” shall be inserted,;
(iii)after the words “without increase” the words “authorized” shall be inserted;
(B) in clause (j),-
(i) for the word, “tonnes”, at both places, the word “ton” shall respectively be substituted;

(i) for the portion beginning with the words “and for the” and ending with the words, “of the Act”, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

“including the impact of storage facilities essential for operating a petroleum and petroleum products
pipeline system as common or contract carrier”

(C) after clause (p), the following shall be added, namely: -

“(q) “spur-line” means a pipeline necessarily originating or branching out from the trunk or another
spur line with diameter and capacity not greater than the trunk pipeline but having no pumping
facility for supply of petroleum and petroleum products to one or more consumers. Any pipeline
having a separate petroleum and petroleum products source or a pump shall not be treated as a spur-
line. The length of spur-line may not depend upon the length of the trunk pipeline. A spur-line must
use the capacity of trunk pipeline in order to transport the petroleum products. Spur line includes
branch line also;”



[T HHl—ETE 4] T T TSI SHTATIT 7

“(r) “tie-in connectivity” means the petroleum and petroleum products pipeline connectivity for
transport of petroleum and petroleum products between a common carrier or contract carrier petroleum
and petroleum products pipeline and any one of the following, namely:-

Q) a petroleum and petroleum products source; or

(i)  a new injection point from another common carrier or contract carrier petroleum and
petroleum products pipeline.”

(b) in regulation 5, -

(A) in sub- regulation (1), for the portion beginning with the words “issue an open” and ending with the
brackets and words “(including webhosting) publishing”, the following shall be substituted, namely: -

“webhost the same at PNGRB’s website giving wide publicity regarding;”
(B) in sub-regulation (5),-

(i)  for the portion beginning with the words, “publish through an” and ending with the brackets and
words “newspaper (including webhosting)”, the word “webhost” shall be substituted,

(if)  after the words “petroleum products pipeline”, the words and letter “on PNGRB’s website”, shall
be inserted;

(iii) sub-regulation (9) shall be omitted.
(c) inregulation 7, -
(A) insub- regulation (1),-
() inclause (a),-
(i)  for the words, “a period of ten years”, the words, following shall be substituted, namely:-
“each year of the economic life of the pipeline starting from its operation”;

(ii) for the words “The tariff shall be bid for each of the ten years” , the words “The tariff shall be
bid for each of the twenty-five years.” shall be substituted;

(iii)  for the word "fifty" the word "forty" shall be substituted;
(1) in Clause (b),-

(i) for the words “a period of ten years”, the words, “each year of the economic life of the
pipeline starting from its operation” shall be substituted;

(if) for the words, “The tariff shall be bid for each of the ten years” the words “The tariff shall be
bid for each of the twenty-five years” shall be substituted;

(iii) for the word “twenty”, the word “forty” shall be substituted;
(1) in clause (c), for the word “thirty”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted;
(B) in sub-regulation (3),-
(i) for the words “sub-regulation”, the words, brackets and figure (1) shall be substituted;

(if)  for the word “volume”, the words, brackets and letters “capacity (MMTPA) proposed to be created”,
shall be substituted;

(iii) after the letters and words “DFR of the project”, the words, brackets and figures, “like, pipeline
length, diameters, spur lines, pumps and other associated facility for petroleum and petroleum
products pipeline as defined under clause (i) of sub- regulation (1) of regulation 2”, shall be
inserted;

(C) after sub-regulation (4), the following shall be added, namely: -

“(5) Year 1 tariff bids for the petroleum and petroleum products pipeline tariff under clauses (a) to (b) of
sub-regulation (1) shall be applicable from 1st year of operation of the pipeline. The pipeline shall be
considered operational when its trunk pipeline is fully commissioned. For partially commissioned trunk
pipeline, only 1st year tariff shall be applicable till its trunk pipeline is fully commissioned.

(6) The Board shall extend the quoted tariff after the economic life of the pipeline for a period
equivalent to the time period between the date of grant of authorization and the starting date of
operation of the pipeline.” ;



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I11—SEC.4]

(d) in regulation 12, -
(i)  sub-regulation (1) shall be omitted;
(if)  for sub-regulation (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) In case it is proposed to expand the capacity of the petroleum and petroleum products pipeling,
the entity shall submit a proposal for consideration of the Board and the Board may allow for
expansion of the capacity in the petroleum and petroleum products pipeline.”;

(iii) after sub-regulation (2), the following shall be added, namely-

“(3) The provisions regarding expansion of capacity in petroleum and petroleum products pipeline
under sub-regulation (2) shall be applicable to all petroleum and petroleum products pipeline either
authorized by the Board under regulation 4, 18, 19 or accepted under regulation 17 as authorized by
the Central Government:

Provided that the Board may alternatively invite bids in place of such proposed expansion, if it is
opined by the Board that invitation of bids shall serve one or more of the following objectives,
namely:-

(i) promoting competition among entities;
(if) avoiding infructuous investment;

(iif) maintaining or increasing supplies or for securing equitable distribution or ensure
adequate availability of petroleum and petroleum products throughout the country;

(iv) protection of customers’ interest in terms of availability of petroleum and petroleum
products at reasonable petroleum and petroleum products pipeline tariff;

(v) incentivizing rapid development of petroleum and petroleum products pipeline
infrastructure.”;

(e) inregulation 21,-

(i) in heading, after the words “expansion or extension”, the words, “or tie-in connectivity or laying of
spur-lines” shall be inserted;

(i) in sub-regulation (1),-

(A) for the words, “the dispatch terminal-", the following shall be inserted, namely: -
“dispatch terminal, or
(v) add a new source by laying Tie-in connectivity, or
(vi) lay a spur line —*;

(B) the first proviso shall be omitted;

(C) in the second proviso, for the words “there shall be no change in pipeline tariff post-extension of
pipeline” the words, “that there shall be no change in the tariff due to such effect” shall be
substituted;

(iii) sub-regulation (2), shall be omitted;
(iv)  for sub-regulation (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(3) In case it is proposed to expand the capacity of the pipeline, the entity shall submit a
proposal for consideration of the Board in consonance with the provisions of regulation 12
and the Board may, after considering the proposal, allow for expansion of the capacity in the
pipeline without adversely affecting the customers served by the pipeline.”;

(v) after sub-regulation (5), the following shall be added, namely: -
“(6) Extension of a petroleum and petroleum products pipeline:

(i)  The entity may extend the authorized length of the petroleum and petroleum products
pipeline up to ten per cent. or 50 kilometer, whichever is lower, from the point of origin
or the end point in the demand centres and shall submit to the Board the full particulars,
map of all facilities including justification for the proposal and seek prior authorization
from the Board:



[T [1l—@e 4]

T T TSI © STETATIT 9

Provided that in case of any technical constraints, the allowed variation in the
originating point of such extension of the petroleum and petroleum products pipeline
from the point of origin or the end point shall not exceed beyond the nearest
sectionalizing valve (SV) station, but the entity shall be required to provide the detailed
justifications for the technical constraints.

(i)  The Board, after public consultation, shall give a decision to the entity within sixty days

of the receipt of the request.

(iii) There shall be no change in the petroleum and petroleum products pipeline tariff post

extension.

(7) Tie-in Connectivity:

(@)

(b)

(©

(d)

In case of the upstream connectivity requirement near a common carrier or contract
carrier petroleum and petroleum products pipeline, a detailed proposal for the
connectivity shall be submitted by the concerned entity to the Board indicating the details
of the sources or injection points facilities, existing petroleum and petroleum products
pipeline infrastructure in vicinity and demand-supply projections along with the length
and capacity of the proposed tie-in connectivity.

The Board shall webhost the proposal for a period of thirty days for initiating the public
consultation process seeking views and comments from the stakeholders.

Based upon the views and comments received during the public consultation process, the
Board may conduct an open house discussion with the stakeholders who have provided
their views.

The Board may authorize such tie-in connectivity as per the following methodology,
namely:-

(i) Tie-in connectivity shall be preferably constructed by the entity owning the common
carrier or contract carrier petroleum and petroleum products pipeline existing near
the product source or injection point provided that the length of such tie-in
connectivity is twenty per cent. of the authorized length of the common carrier or
contract carrier petroleum and petroleum products pipeline subject to a maximum of
200 kilometer:

Provided that in case of more than one petroleum and petroleum products
pipeline existing near the product source or injection point, the entity owning and
operating the common carrier or contract carrier petroleum and petroleum products
pipeline nearest to the source shall have first right of refusal for laying tie-in
connectivity subsequently in the order of physical proximity;

Provided further that in case the entities owning and operating the common
carrier or contract carrier petroleum and petroleum products pipeline refuse to lay the
said tie-in connectivity, the Board may authorize the interested entity who initiated
the proposal with the terms and conditions to lay the said tie-in connectivity and in
such a case, the interested entity shall be considered as “shipper” in terms of the
Petroleum and Natural Gas Regulatory Board (Access Code of Conduct for Common
Carrier or Contract Carrier Petroleum and Petroleum Products Pipelines)
Regulations, 2016;

(i)  The Board may also consider inviting bids for the subject tie-in connectivity as per
the provisions of sub-regulation (5) of regulation 5;

(ili) Any proposal to construct tie-in pipeline connectivity exceeding the length as
provided in sub-clause (i) shall be dealt in line with the relevant provisions of the
regulations for competitive bidding route;

(8) Laying of spur-lines:

The entity initiating the request for a spur line shall inform the Board of its intentions along with

the full

details on the spur-line length, route, capacity and details of the customers to be served and

the Board after public consultation shall give its decision to the entity within sixty days of the
receipt of the request.



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART I11—SEC.4]

(9) The Board may alternatively invite bids in place of such proposal submitted under this
regulations, if it is opined by the Board that invitation of bids shall serve one or more of the
following objectives, namely:-

(i) promoting competition among entities;
(if) avoiding infructuous investment;

(iif) maintaining or increasing supplies or for securing equitable distribution or ensure adequate
availability of petroleum and petroleum products throughout the country;

(iv) protection of customers’ interest in terms of availability of petroleum and petroleum
products at reasonable petroleum and petroleum products pipeline tariff;

(v) incentivizing rapid development of petroleum and petroleum products pipeline
infrastructure.”;

(f) in Part— 11 of Schedule B,-
(i) for the words “ten years”, the words “twenty five years”, shall be substituted;
(i) for the word and figures “Year 10” the word and figures “Year 25” shall be substituted;

(iii) The portion beginning with the words “The Board shall” and ending with the words “on
prospective basis.” shall be omitted :

(9) in Schedule C,-
(1 for the words “ten years” the words, “twenty five years” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the figures, marks and letters, “0.50 x LFT1 + 0.20 x LVT1 + 0.30 x HC1”, the figures,
marks and letters “0.40 x LFT1 + 0.40 x LVTI1 + 0.20 x HC1” shall be substituted ;

(iii)  for the figures, marks and letters, “0.50 x LFT2 + 0.20 x LVT2 + 0.30 x HC2” the figures,
marks and letters “0.40 x LFT2 + 0.40 x LVT2 + 0.20 x HC2” shall be substituted ;

(iv) for the figures, marks and letters, “0.50 x LFT3 + 0.20 x LVT3 + 0.30 x HC3” the figures,
marks and letters “0.40 x LFT3 + 0.40 x LVT3 + 0.20 x HC3” shall be substituted.

VANDANA SHARMA, Secy.
[ADVT.-111/4/Exty./623/2023-24]

Footnote: The Principal regulations were notified vide G.S.R. 722(E), dated 01/09/2010 and subsequently amended
vide F. No. L-MISC/VI/1/2007, dated 01/01/2015 and F. No. VKS/DB/03/PPL, dated 29.03.2016.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. wmavos

KUMAR
VERMA




		2023-12-19T22:29:09+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




